
BID TABULATION
Marking Paint

Bid #PUR1117-089

December 22, 2017 at 3:00pm CST

Blackburn 

Manufacturing

Campbell 

Supply Co

HD Supply 

White Cap

Safety Zone 

Specilists, Inc

The Serwin-

Williams Co

Neligh, NE
Cedar Rapids, 

IA

Cedar Rapids, 

IA
Lakeland, FL

Cedar Rapids, 

IA

No Yes Yes No Yes

Line Item Description

Bid Submittal Form

1 Upside Down Paint - Water Based

Brand Name Krylon Seymour Rustoleum Seymour Seymour

Price Per Can $4.03 $2.42 $3.10 $3.20 $3.4000

Price Per Case $48.36 $29.04 $37.20 $38.40 $40.80

Number of Cans in Case 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 Cans

Available Colors see bid See Bid

Estimated Delivery Time 7-10 days 1-7 days 10 days 7-10 days 2 days

2 Upside Down Paint - Solvent Based

Brand Name Krylon Seymour Rustoleum Seymour Seymour

Price Per Can $4.25 $2.52 $2.64 $3.50 $3.70

Price Per Case $51.00 $30.24 $31.68 $42.00 $44.40

Number of Cans in Case 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 cans

Available Colors see bid See Bid

Estimated Delivery Time 7-10 days 1-7 days 10 days 7-10 days 2 days

3 Trigger Cap Paint - Water Based

Brand Name No Bid Seymour No Bid Seymour Seymour

Price Per Can $3.09 $3.20 $3.69

Price Per Case $37.08 $38.40 $44.28

Number of Cans in Case 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 cans

Available Colors see bid See Bid

Estimated Delivery Time 1-7 days 7-10 days 2 days

4 Trigger Cap Paint - Solvent Based

Brand Name No Bid Seymour No Bid Seymour Seymour

Price Per Can $3.59 $3.50 $3.99

Price Per Case $43.08 $42.00 $47.88

VENDORS

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

Vendor Location
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BID TABULATION
Marking Paint

Bid #PUR1117-089

December 22, 2017 at 3:00pm CST

Blackburn 

Manufacturing

Campbell 

Supply Co

HD Supply 

White Cap

Safety Zone 

Specilists, Inc

The Serwin-

Williams Co

Neligh, NE
Cedar Rapids, 

IA

Cedar Rapids, 

IA
Lakeland, FL

Cedar Rapids, 

IA

No Yes Yes No Yes

Line Item Description

VENDORS

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

Vendor Location

Number of Cans in Case 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 Cans

Available Colors see bid See Bid

Estimated Delivery Time 1-7 days 7-10 days 2 days

5 Traffic Marking Paint - Water Based

Brand Name No Bid Seymour Rustoleum Seymour Seymour

Price Per Can $3.09 $3.10 $3.66 $3.990

Price Per Case $37.08 $37.20 $49.92

Number of Cans in Case 12 Cans 12 Cans 12 cans

Available Colors see bid See Bid

Estimated Delivery Time 1-7 days 7-10 days 2 days

6 Traffic Marking Paint - Solvent Based

Brand Name Krylon Seymour Rustoleum Seymour Seymour

Price Per Can $4.81 $3.59 $2.64 $4.40 $4.25

Price Per Case $57.72 $43.08 $31.68 $51.00

Number of Cans in Case 12 Cans 12 cans 12 Cans 12 cans

Available Colors see bid See Bid

Estimated Delivery Time 7-10 days 1-7 days 7-10 days 2 days

7 Stake Wire Flagging - 4"x5", No Printing

Brand Name Blackburn Presco Presco Trinity No Bid

Price Per 21" Flag $0.066 $0.1053 $0.0660 $0.0940

Price Per Case $66.00 $105.3000 $66.0000 $94.0000

Price Per 30" Flag $0.075 $0.1125 $0.0850 $0.0980

Price Per Case $75.00 $112.50 $85.00 $98.00

Number of Flags in Case 1000 Flags 1000 Flags 1000 Flags 1000 Flags

Available Colors see bid standard colors
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BID TABULATION
Marking Paint

Bid #PUR1117-089

December 22, 2017 at 3:00pm CST

Blackburn 

Manufacturing

Campbell 

Supply Co

HD Supply 

White Cap

Safety Zone 

Specilists, Inc

The Serwin-

Williams Co

Neligh, NE
Cedar Rapids, 

IA

Cedar Rapids, 

IA
Lakeland, FL

Cedar Rapids, 

IA

No Yes Yes No Yes

Line Item Description

VENDORS

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

Vendor Location

Estimated Delivery Time 7-10 days 1-7 days 10 days 7-10 days

8 Stake Wire Flagging, 5"x8", No Printing

Brand Name Blackburn Presco Presco Trinity No Bid

Price Per 30" Flag $0.085 $0.1644 $0.107 $0.114

Price Per Case $85.00 $164.40 $107.00 $114.00

Number of Flags in Case 1000 Flags 1000 Flags 1000 Flags 1000 Flags

Available Colors see bid standard colors

Estimated Delivery Time 7-10 days 7 days 10 days 7-10 days

9 Stake Wire Flagging, 4"x5", Printed 

Brand Name Blackburn Presco Presco Trinity No Bid

Price Per Flag $0.088 $0.1190 $0.0660 $0.1010

Price Per Case $88.00 $119.00 $66.00 $101.00

Number of Flags in Case 1000 Flags 1000 Flags 1000 Flags 1000 Flags

Estimated Delivery Time 7-10 Days 10-14 days 15 days 7-10 days

Signature Page

1 Exceptions

$20 one-time 

imprint charge 

for flag printing

$25 set up 

charge per print

2 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

3 Quick Pay Discount N/A No N/A No N/A
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